
Abdominal Pain Worksheet 7

Guided Visual Imagery Relaxation: The Beach

Lay down, or sit comfortably in a quiet room. Use the deep breathing techniques you 
learnt earlier in this pack, close your eyes and listen to somebody read you the 
following script. You can also read this script to yourself. You may find it more relaxing 
to play an audio track of crashing waves on the beach; this can be sourced on 
YouTube, Spotify, and most other online music platforms.

You’re walking down a long wooden stairway to a big, beautiful beach. It is very quiet 
and stretches off into the distance as far as you can see. As you look down you notice 
that the sunlight is reflecting off of the golden sand. You step into the sand, it feels 
warm so you wriggle your toes. You notice the warmth from the sand between your 
toes and around your feet. You notice the sounds of the waves crashing and chasing 
you up the shore, the water sparkles like a diamond as it retreats back. The roaring 
sound of the waves is so soothing that you can just let go of any worries. 

The ocean is a beautiful light blue, with patches of darker sapphire in the deep. As 
you look at these deep blue areas you notice a small sailboat on the horizon. All of 
these sights help you to let go of any worries and relax even more.

As you continue walking along the beach, you become aware of the fresh salty sea 
air. You look up take a slow deep breath in, and breath out. This breath makes you 
feel refreshed and relaxed. As you look up you notice two seagulls, the wind gusts 
and they appear to dance in graceful circles above you. It makes you wonder how it 
would feel if you could fly under the warm sun. 

You find yourself settling into a deep state of relaxation as you walk further down the 
beach. You feel the sun wrap its warm arms around you, the warmth relaxes all of 
your muscles. You notice a beach chair as you walk down the beach, once you reach 
it you take a seat. Laying back in this comfortable chair makes you reflect on 
everything you have felt, seen and thought at this beach. You drift into a deeper state 
of relaxation. 

Now, feeling relaxed and at peace, you slowly rise from the beach chair and step into 
the warm sand to walk home. As you walk, you remember how relaxing this beach 
has been, and you know that you can come back to this place anytime you like. You 
start to climb the wooden stairs and gradually bring yourself back into the room. 
When you are ready, you can open your eyes.


